
 

   

 
 

   

     
       

 

 

       
     

   
 

  

      
      

    
 

 

       
     

     
   

     

       
      

      
    

   

  

       
     

     
       

          
            

        
     

     
 

 

      
       

     
    

  

       
    

        
 

        

     
  

 

    
          

     

 

 

UNIVERSITY OF KENTUCKY
 

Degree/ Diploma Programme 

Does your University/College accept the 
HKCEE and HKALE for admission to your 
University/College? 

Yes 

What are the entry requirements for a 
student with HKCEE and HKALE 
qualifications entering your 
University/College? 

http://www.uky.edu/Admission/international.htm 

Do students with HKCEE and HKALE 
qualifications have to sit an entrance 
examination to enter your 
University/College? 

No 

Is there a language proficiency test that 
students with HKCEE and HKALE 
qualifications wishing to enter your 
University/College must take? 

Yes – TOEFL or IELTS 

Is there a standard on an international 
English scale that students with HKCEE 
and HKALE qualifications wishing to enter 
your University/College must reach? 

71 TOEFL ibt 

6.0 IELTS 

Are there any other tests that students 
with HKCEE and HKALE qualifications 
wishing to enter your University/College 
must take? When must they be taken? 

Math proficiency for engineering majors – usually demonstrated by an 
SAT score; math test can also be taken upon arrival to campus 

Is there an entry quota that applies to 
students with HKCEE and HKALE 
qualifications wishing to enter your 
University/College? 

no 

Where can information be obtained on 
fees and other charges for students with 
HKCEE and HKALE qualifications wishing 
to enter your University/College? 

http://www.uky.edu/IntlAffairs/students_scholars/pros_tuition.html 

Is consideration given to factors other than 
examination performance for overseas 
students wishing to apply for entry to your 
University/College? 

Yes – extracurricular activities, community service, etc. 

Does your University/College accept the 
International Baccalaureate? 

Yes 

Does your University/College accept 
students if they are under the age of 18 at 
the time of commencing studies? 

Yes 


